
[[634065]] VOLVO A45G 352411 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP440279
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 634065

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10765289Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06020789 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:36:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440279 VCP427064 VCP377495 VCP317688Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 19 Jun 2023 30 Apr 2022 17 Jul 2021Machine Hours 6275 5591 3478 2213Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 303 275 277 280
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 3 2 2Sodium ppm 1 <1 1 <1Potassium ppm 2 <1 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 69 154 134 122Copper ppm 1 4 2 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 0Chromium ppm 1 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 2Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 9 8 7Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 109 68 46Magnesium ppm 9 7 8 7Zinc ppm 36 77 50 33Phosphorus ppm 1019 982 1090 1035Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 181 98 81 213

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06020789 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:36:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352411\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP440279] 22 Nov 2023 @ 6275.0 hrs

