
[[67829 AK GRADING]] TAKEUCHI TL8 408004728 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP429359
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 67829 AK GRADING

COWIN EQUIPMENT - ATLANTA5710 RIVERVIEW RDMABLETON, GAUS  30126Contact: MIKE ANDREWSmandrews@cowin.comT: (404)690-7210F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COWMABUnique No: 10765297Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Dec 2023
Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06020797 (Generated: 12/03/2023 10:17:37) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429359 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 108 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 160 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 556 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 83 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 51 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 273 --- --- ---Barium ppm 15 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWMAB [WUSCAR] 06020797 (Generated: 12/03/2023 10:17:39) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: MIKE ANDREWS - COWMAB
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL8 408004728\Front Right Final Drive [VCP429359] 27 Nov 2023 @ 108.0 hrs

