
[[634484 ALTA RENTS]] VOLVO L70H 623714 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP430595
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 634484 ALTA RENTS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10765314Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06020814 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:36:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430595 VCP412625 VCP408206 VCP317966Sample Date 21 Nov 2023 16 Aug 2023 29 Mar 2023 16 Sep 2021Machine Hours 3717 3333 2744 1251Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.1 49.1 48.9 40.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 11 17 15 13Sodium ppm 1 8 6 6Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 72 61 73Copper ppm <1 10 13 25Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 1 1 2Aluminum ppm 1 1 1 1Chromium ppm <1 2 2 3Molybdenum ppm 0 1 3 4Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 5 4 9Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3868 4510 3666 4094Magnesium ppm 18 33 31 12Zinc ppm 1660 1918 1538 1650Phosphorus ppm 1340 1499 1214 1343Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 126 169 125 148

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06020814 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:36:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623714\Rear Axle [VCP430595] 21 Nov 2023 @ 3717.0 hrs

