
[[SW-26767-2]] VOLVO EC210BLC 16849 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414470
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SW-26767-2

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of fuelpresent in the oil. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10765877Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06021377 (Generated: 12/04/2023 15:25:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414470 VCP412541 VCP406973 ---Sample Date 29 Nov 2023 29 Aug 2023 10 Aug 2023 ---Machine Hours 9460 9439 9439 ---Oil Hours 0 20 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL MARGINAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 9.6 10.2 11.1 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.3 7.0 7.0 ---Oxidation (PA) % 43 43 44 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.1 0 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 36 35 34 ---Sulfation (PA) % 45 46 45 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 6.4 6.1 3.2 ---Silicon ppm 17 14 10 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 <1 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 15 12 ---Copper ppm 4 2 2 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 3 3 2 ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 31 36 40 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1076 1069 1018 ---Magnesium ppm 446 539 574 ---Zinc ppm 866 915 953 ---Phosphorus ppm 767 785 801 ---Barium ppm 0 2 0 ---Boron ppm 14 24 14 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06021377 (Generated: 12/04/2023 15:25:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC210BLC 16849\Diesel Engine [VCP414470] 29 Nov 2023 @ 9460.0 hrs

