
[[SPM621717]] VOLVO EC480E 315179 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP382897
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM621717

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level has decreased, but is stillabnormal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10766811Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Dec 2023
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06022311 (Generated: 12/05/2023 03:05:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP382897 VCP409216 --- ---Sample Date 10 Nov 2023 27 Jul 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1086 615 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 10.9 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.7 4.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 73 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.1 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 75 84 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 56 59 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.8 --- ---Silicon ppm 6 26 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 14 --- ---Copper ppm 68 194 --- ---Lead ppm 0 2 --- ---Tin ppm <1 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 4 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 53 76 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1150 2143 --- ---Magnesium ppm 752 173 --- ---Zinc ppm 1059 1196 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 855 962 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 4 18 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06022311 (Generated: 12/05/2023 03:05:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 315179\Diesel Engine [VCP382897] 10 Nov 2023 @ 1086.0 hrs

