
[[SPM621411]] SENNEBOGEN 825ME 825.0.3415 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP425259
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM621411

ALL AMERICAN RECYCLING11900 S COTTAGE GROVE AVECHICAGO, ILUS  60628Contact: TOM BOCHENEKferrous@aarecylcles.comT: (815)735-9892F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a light amount ofsilt (particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ALLCHIILUnique No: 10766939Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 Dec 2023
Report Id: ALLCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06022439 (Generated: 12/04/2023 10:54:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM BOCHENEK - ALLCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425259 VCP415075 VCP418523 VCP410843Sample Date 10 Nov 2023 25 Aug 2023 08 May 2023 09 Mar 2023Machine Hours 7516 7037 6085 5539Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.8 39.2 40.1 38.8Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.49 0.56 0.55 0.46
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 5190 2662 1951 18000Particles >6µm 1042 606 360 5362Particles >14µm 70 36 26 203ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/17/13 19/16/12 18/16/12 21/20/15Silicon ppm 0 <1 0 1Sodium ppm 8 7 2 3Potassium ppm 0 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 8 7 5Copper ppm 3 3 2 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 <1 0 <1Chromium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 200 319 226 220Magnesium ppm 0 0 1 3Zinc ppm 286 385 331 333Phosphorus ppm 244 333 279 279Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALLCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06022439 (Generated: 12/04/2023 10:54:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOM BOCHENEK - ALLCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825ME 825.0.3415\Hydraulic System [VCP425259] 10 Nov 2023 @ 7516.0 hrs

