
VOLVO EC350EL 314042 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP378422
Oil Type: SHELL Rotella T5 15W-40
Job No:

FREDERICK COUNTY LANDFILL107 NORTH KENT STREETWINCHESTER, VAUS  26014Contact: DAVE BRADFIELDdbradfie@fcva.usT: (540)535-5041F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: FREWINUnique No: 10767955Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 05 Dec 2023
Report Id: FREWIN [WUSCAR] 06023455 (Generated: 12/08/2023 16:08:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BRADFIELD - FREWIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP378422 VCP378475 VCP315681 VCP315683Sample Date 03 Nov 2023 22 Mar 2023 23 Jun 2022 25 Oct 2021Machine Hours 3412 3043 2523 1994Oil Hours 369 500 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.7 11.7 12.2 11.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.0 5.7 5.6 ---Oxidation (PA) % 50 51 46 59
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 69 77 69 66Sulfation (PA) % 50 54 52 53Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 6 3 4Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 12Potassium ppm 1 <1 0 27
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 4 4 6Copper ppm 2 7 7 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 77 73 42 72Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2039 2145 2092 1853Magnesium ppm 108 125 107 413Zinc ppm 1128 1235 1097 1200Phosphorus ppm 939 1028 868 1061Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 82 40 31 85

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FREWIN [WUSCAR] 06023455 (Generated: 12/08/2023 16:08:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE BRADFIELD - FREWIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314042\Diesel Engine [VCP378422] 03 Nov 2023 @ 3412.0 hrs

