
[[X10692]] VOLVO EC300DL 210381 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413418
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X10692

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Texarkana5401 SANDERSON LANETEXARKANA, ARUS  71854Contact: JAMES DOSSjdoss@scottcompanies.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. No evidence of fuel orcoolant present in the oil. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO1034Unique No: 10767963Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 05 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06023463 (Generated: 12/05/2023 16:45:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMES DOSS - VOLVO1034

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413418 VCP423444 --- ---Sample Date 21 Nov 2023 26 May 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 6419 6326 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.3 15.4 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 12.7 10.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 89 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 2.4 3.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 69 105 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 73 83 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 10 10 --- ---Sodium ppm 22 33 --- ---Potassium ppm 11 12 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 45 --- ---Copper ppm 2 4 --- ---Lead ppm 0 1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 8 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 39 47 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1620 1760 --- ---Magnesium ppm 470 578 --- ---Zinc ppm 1057 1186 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 857 938 --- ---Barium ppm 2 0 --- ---Boron ppm 43 24 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06023463 (Generated: 12/05/2023 16:45:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JAMES DOSS - VOLVO1034
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300DL 210381\Diesel Engine [VCP413418] 21 Nov 2023 @ 6419.0 hrs

