
[[W010713610 STANLEY]] VOLVO A35G 342028 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP409424
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: W010713610 STANLEY

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10768671Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 06 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06024171 (Generated: 12/08/2023 03:01:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409424 VCP271073 VCP219475 ---Sample Date 30 Nov 2023 28 Jan 2020 03 Jan 2018 ---Machine Hours 8454 2952 293 ---Oil Hours 0 0 293 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.2 41.3 41.13 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 9 21 21 ---Sodium ppm 2 4 3 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 44 19 ---Copper ppm 231 302 11 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 ---Nickel ppm 3 6 2 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3296 3955 4024 ---Magnesium ppm 9 8 8 ---Zinc ppm 1417 1601 1476 ---Phosphorus ppm 1240 1265 1303 ---Barium ppm 2 0 0 ---Boron ppm 111 104 111 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06024171 (Generated: 12/08/2023 03:01:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 342028\Wet Disc Brake [VCP409424] 30 Nov 2023 @ 8454.0 hrs

