
[[5024HR RITCHIE BRO]] VOLVO L90F 68193 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP430581
Oil Type: TDH FLUID SAE 70W80
Job No: 5024HR RITCHIE BRO

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY CO MAINPO BOX 1957HARRISBURG, PAUS  17105Contact: WADE MADERwmader@hwyequip.comT: (717)564-3031F: (717)564-3568
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0025Unique No: 10769937Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 07 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 06025437 (Generated: 12/07/2023 12:23:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WADE MADER - VOLVO0025

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430581 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 23801 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 38.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 13 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3337 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1431 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1178 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0025 [WUSCAR] 06025437 (Generated: 12/07/2023 12:23:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WADE MADER - VOLVO0025
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90F 68193\Rear Axle [VCP430581] 30 Nov 2023 @ 23801.0 hrs

