
[[50423 CONTOUR]] VOLVO A40F 11336 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP405157
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 50423 CONTOUR

367 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - BUFORD3779 RYDER BLVDBUFORD, GAUS  30519Contact: AARON MANDERSaaron.manders@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (678)318-9534
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8529Unique No: 10769945Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 06 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 06025445 (Generated: 12/06/2023 20:05:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AARON MANDERS - VOLVO8529

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405157 VCE152389 VCE166914 ---Sample Date 28 Nov 2023 12 Jun 2013 11 May 2012 ---Machine Hours 10446 0 1002 ---Oil Hours 0 0 1002 ---Oil Changed Changed N/A Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 266 99.21 68.35 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 22 5 44 ---Sodium ppm 19 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 10 7 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 65 9 68 ---Copper ppm 1 0 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 1 2 ---Tin ppm <1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 8 1 8 ---Chromium ppm 2 <1 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 12 <1 11 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 2 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 181 62 170 ---Magnesium ppm 39 9 38 ---Zinc ppm 165 34 57 ---Phosphorus ppm 983 949 1787 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 117 161 205 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8529 [WUSCAR] 06025445 (Generated: 12/06/2023 20:05:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: AARON MANDERS - VOLVO8529
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40F 11336\Drop Box [VCP405157] 28 Nov 2023 @ 10446.0 hrs

