
[[SWA423510 LAFARGE]] VOLVO A45G 353641 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP390092
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWA423510 LAFARGE

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: KEVIN SKRTICHKEVIN.SKRTICH@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Gearwear is indicated. Elemental level ofsilicon (Si) above normal indicatingingress of dirt/seal material. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 10776619Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 07 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 06026828 (Generated: 12/07/2023 16:36:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP390092 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2025 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 48.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 59 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 11 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 562 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 10 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 47 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 78 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1990 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 155 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 06026828 (Generated: 12/07/2023 16:36:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN SKRTICH - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353641\Drop Box [VCP390092] 04 Dec 2023 @ 2025.0 hrs

