
[[SW-27111-2 CASTLE]] VOLVO EC210BLC 16751 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP414471
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-27111-2 CASTLE

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10776642Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06026851 (Generated: 12/12/2023 20:48:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414471 VCP387748 VCP348861 ---Sample Date 29 Nov 2023 13 Oct 2022 08 Mar 2022 ---Machine Hours 2580 1348 827 ---Oil Hours 1100 0 1000 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 164 166 173 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.173 0.792 2.06 ---Silicon ppm 4 11 11 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 49 81 101 ---Copper ppm 3 10 13 ---Lead ppm 0 6 6 ---Tin ppm 0 1 1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 2 5 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 53 2 2 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 161 1180 1601 ---Magnesium ppm 3 22 25 ---Zinc ppm 102 490 602 ---Phosphorus ppm 868 1149 1071 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 80 92 64 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06026851 (Generated: 12/12/2023 20:48:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC210BLC 16751\Swing Drive [VCP414471] 29 Nov 2023 @ 2580.0 hrs

