
[[TRANSPORT LEASING]] VOLVO L220H 3546 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429832
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: TRANSPORT LEASING

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 10777244Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06027453 (Generated: 12/09/2023 12:57:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429832 VCP400071 --- ---Sample Date 30 Nov 2023 10 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1082 442 --- ---Oil Hours 0 442 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 11.2 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.5 5.9 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 64 60 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.2 0.2 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 62 75 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 55 52 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.5 --- ---Silicon ppm 11 24 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 84 12 --- ---Copper ppm 11 462 --- ---Lead ppm 0 5 --- ---Tin ppm <1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 12 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 64 84 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1167 2157 --- ---Magnesium ppm 783 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1114 1209 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 937 984 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 17 43 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06027453 (Generated: 12/09/2023 12:57:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3546\Diesel Engine [VCP429832] 30 Nov 2023 @ 1082.0 hrs

