
[[W02007788]] VOLVO EC350EL 310806 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP384488
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 85W140
Job No: W02007788

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10777966Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06028175 (Generated: 12/10/2023 12:19:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP384488 VCP319132 VCP286014 VCP290685Sample Date 30 Nov 2023 03 Nov 2021 07 Apr 2021 24 Nov 2020Machine Hours 5964 3986 3580 3080Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 156 174 164 130
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 120 54 148 152Sodium ppm 4 <1 <1 <1Potassium ppm 10 14 6 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 642 204 460 214Copper ppm 2 <1 1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 18 8 20 38Chromium ppm 7 2 5 4Molybdenum ppm 17 12 18 21Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 2 <1 2 3Silver ppm 0 0 1 <1Manganese ppm 4 1 3 2Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 539 370 519 782Magnesium ppm 126 102 123 125Zinc ppm 297 205 291 363Phosphorus ppm 936 755 965 819Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 162 134 166 137

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06028175 (Generated: 12/10/2023 12:19:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310806\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP384488] 30 Nov 2023 @ 5964.0 hrs

