
[[TRANSPORT LEASING]] VOLVO L180H 3090 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP400158
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: TRANSPORT LEASING

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 10778033Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06028242 (Generated: 12/10/2023 12:51:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP400158 VCP360554 VCP335694 ---Sample Date 29 Nov 2023 11 Apr 2022 10 Mar 2022 ---Machine Hours 20392 16901 16583 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL SEVERE ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.4 26.7 24.5 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 4 3 7 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 3 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 101 61 269 ---Copper ppm 5 2 11 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 3 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 91 94 134 ---Magnesium ppm 4 2 7 ---Zinc ppm 4 7 28 ---Phosphorus ppm 208 215 233 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 86 100 71 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06028242 (Generated: 12/10/2023 12:51:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 3090\Transmission [VCP400158] 29 Nov 2023 @ 20392.0 hrs

