
VOLVO EC480E 311286 - BOGIE/CENTER LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP441123
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - WISEPO BOX 1158WISE, VAUS  24293Contact: DANNY BARRINGTONdbarrington@mcclung-logan.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Metallevels are typical for a componentsfirst oil change. There is no indicationof any contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8881Unique No: 10779530Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8881 [WUSCAR] 06029739 (Generated: 12/12/2023 12:52:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BARRINGTON - VOLVO8881

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441123 --- --- ---Sample Date 30 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6054 --- --- ---Oil Hours 6054 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 330 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.090 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 72 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 14 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1091 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 11 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 27 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1025 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 148 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8881 [WUSCAR] 06029739 (Generated: 12/12/2023 12:52:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BARRINGTON - VOLVO8881
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 311286\Bogie/Center Left Final Drive [VCP441123] 30 Nov 2023 @ 6054.0 hrs

