
[[SWA420582]] VOLVO A45 353728 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP433345
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA420582

Phillips & JordanPO BOX 2295Zephyerhills, FLUS  33539-2295Contact: DANNY BOYDDBOYD@PANDJ.COMT: (813)783-2499F: (813)715-7354
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. Fuelcontent negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: PHIZEPUnique No: 10779638Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: PHIZEP [WUSCAR] 06029847 (Generated: 12/18/2023 17:26:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BOYD - PHIZEP

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433345 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 477 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.5 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 55 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 77 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 28 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 268 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 93 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2248 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1249 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 994 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 70 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PHIZEP [WUSCAR] 06029847 (Generated: 12/18/2023 17:26:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BOYD - PHIZEP
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45 353728\Diesel Engine [VCP433345] 27 Nov 2023 @ 477.0 hrs

