
VOLVO L150G NR23026 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP436345
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA ELC EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No:

MARYLAND ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES21210 MARTINSBURG RDDICKERSON, MDUS  20842Contact: ALAN PARRISHaparr@menv.comT: (301)428-8185F: (301)428-8311
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: MARDICUnique No: 10779920Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Dec 2023
Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 06030129 (Generated: 12/13/2023 15:25:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436345 VCP418081 VCP396629 VCP405011Sample Date 05 Dec 2023 06 Sep 2023 05 Jun 2023 24 Mar 2023Machine Hours 13014 12744 12465 12252Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.45 7.48 7.49 8.52Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT NT NTPercentage Glycol % 51.3 51.2 50.9 51.0Freezing Point °C -38 -38 -35 -38
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Red Orange Red LtRedSand/Dirt scalar --- NONE --- ---Debris scalar --- NONE --- ---Precipitate scalar --- NONE --- ---Silt scalar --- NONE --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 06030129 (Generated: 12/13/2023 15:25:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150G NR23026\Coolant [VCP436345] 05 Dec 2023 @ 13014.0 hrs

