
[[SPM633674-10 CARMUSE]] VOLVO A60H 350292 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409098
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SPM633674-10 CARMUSE

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: NATE ROSZCZEWSKInate.roszczewski@altaequipment.comT: F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Valve wear is indicated.Sodium and/or potassium levels arehigh. There is a high concentration ofglycol present in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10780142Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06030351 (Generated: 12/13/2023 15:31:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NATE ROSZCZEWSKI - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409098 VCP390168 --- ---Sample Date 16 Nov 2023 08 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1648 597 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 10.9 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 11.8 5.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 61 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.6 0.9 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 89 79 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 68 55 --- ---Glycol % 0.10 NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 1.3 --- ---Silicon ppm 7 32 --- ---Sodium ppm 1433 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 250 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 45 --- ---Copper ppm 48 246 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 3 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 58 87 --- ---Nickel ppm 8 4 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1701 2326 --- ---Magnesium ppm 479 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1125 1272 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 920 990 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 6 28 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06030351 (Generated: 12/13/2023 15:31:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NATE ROSZCZEWSKI - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350292\Diesel Engine [VCP409098] 16 Nov 2023 @ 1648.0 hrs

