
[[24557]] VOLVO L110H 632055 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429019
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 24557

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 10782874Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 21 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06033083 (Generated: 12/22/2023 07:47:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429019 VCP411047 VCP404415 VCP376769Sample Date 05 Dec 2023 03 May 2023 10 Jan 2023 28 Feb 2022Machine Hours 2622 2054 1679 1221Oil Hours 0 1000 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 13.2 13.3 12.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.5 9.3 10.8 11.1Oxidation (PA) % 63 77 81 84
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 54 48 58 63Sulfation (PA) % 55 56 61 64Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 4 6 7Sodium ppm 0 1 <1 1Potassium ppm 2 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 6 11 11Copper ppm 2 <1 3 4Lead ppm <1 0 1 1Tin ppm 1 0 1 1Aluminum ppm 5 4 6 13Chromium ppm 1 <1 1 1Molybdenum ppm 27 42 43 44Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2192 1742 1772 1540Magnesium ppm 321 561 519 512Zinc ppm 1101 1242 1213 1072Phosphorus ppm 848 992 940 852Barium ppm 11 0 0 0Boron ppm 50 54 38 42

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06033083 (Generated: 12/22/2023 07:47:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 632055\Diesel Engine [VCP429019] 05 Dec 2023 @ 2622.0 hrs

