
VOLVO A30G 742658 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP0008121
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10783210Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06033419 (Generated: 12/21/2023 13:51:58) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008121 VCP0008119 VCP0008086 VCP303970Sample Date 11 Dec 2023 04 Dec 2023 02 Oct 2023 10 Mar 2021Machine Hours 1534 1534 0 938Oil Hours 1534 1534 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 96.5 45.3 45.9 47.9Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.44 0.41 0.39 0.471
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 76669 1278 22300 ---Particles >6µm 18713 490 8091 ---Particles >14µm 348 83 706 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/21/16 17/16/14 22/20/17 ---Silicon ppm 8 1 5 0Sodium ppm 1 0 2 1Potassium ppm 1 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 0 11 6Copper ppm 0 0 5 6Lead ppm 0 0 4 3Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 5 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 38 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1633 55 93 93Magnesium ppm 470 <1 2 0Zinc ppm 1124 420 469 704Phosphorus ppm 955 322 341 558Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 73 0 0 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06033419 (Generated: 12/21/2023 13:52:01) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742658\Hydraulic System [VCP0008121] 11 Dec 2023 @ 1534.0 hrs

