
[[SWO-068096 APAC]] VOLVO EC480E 314549 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP414654
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SWO-068096 APAC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC1501 HWY 78 EASTOXFORD, ALUS  36203Contact: STEVE CAMPBELLstcampbell@cowin.comT: (256)832-5053F: (256)831-4295
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: COWOXFUnique No: 10788997Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Dec 2023
Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06033768 (Generated: 12/17/2023 13:43:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE CAMPBELL - COWOXF

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414654 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4060 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 314 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.395 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 73 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1013 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 118 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06033768 (Generated: 12/17/2023 13:43:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE CAMPBELL - COWOXF
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314549\Right Swing Drive [VCP414654] 08 Dec 2023 @ 4060.0 hrs

