
PUMP 3 - PUMP

Sample No: VCP326069
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

HOLCIM US3210 WATLING STEAST CHICAGO, INUS  46312Contact: LINDA FLORESLINDA.FLORES@HOLCIM.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is ISO 150R&O Hydraulic Oil.  Please confirmthe oil type and grade, and specifythe brand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HOLEASINUnique No: 10789008Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Dec 2023
Report Id: HOLEASIN [WUSCAR] 06033779 (Generated: 12/14/2023 15:36:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LINDA FLORES - HOLEASIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP326069 VCP386777 VCP386722 VCP386948Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 22 Sep 2023 15 Sep 2023 24 Jan 2023Machine Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 150 148 148 958
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG 14.6Silicon ppm 2 3 14 21Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 0Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 12
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 11 22 506Copper ppm 0 <1 1 11Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 0 4Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 6Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 5Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2 20 3 25Magnesium ppm <1 0 <1 8Zinc ppm 0 0 1 0Phosphorus ppm 79 88 118 19Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HOLEASIN [WUSCAR] 06033779 (Generated: 12/14/2023 15:36:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LINDA FLORES - HOLEASIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PUMP 3\Pump [VCP326069] 22 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

