
[[10011 D2 LLC]] VOLVO EC200E 314204 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP388519
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 85W140
Job No: 10011 D2 LLC

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - BALTIMORE4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10789025Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06033796 (Generated: 12/17/2023 15:38:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388519 VCP390019 VCP340146 VCP308771Sample Date 05 Dec 2023 27 Oct 2022 04 Jan 2022 16 Aug 2021Machine Hours 3182 1979 965 528Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 313 260 263 169
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 5 4 7Sodium ppm 0 0 0 2Potassium ppm 5 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 46 63 40 80Copper ppm 4 9 6 13Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 29 20 48 1Magnesium ppm <1 <1 0 0Zinc ppm <1 18 29 4Phosphorus ppm 1021 803 774 429Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 189 120 125 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06033796 (Generated: 12/17/2023 15:38:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200E 314204\Swing Drive [VCP388519] 05 Dec 2023 @ 3182.0 hrs

