
[[9992 WASTE CONNECT]] VOLVO L90G 617183 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP388516
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 9992 WASTE CONNECT

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - BALTIMORE4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10789027Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06033798 (Generated: 12/15/2023 08:52:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388516 VCP344987 VCP196917 VCP226719Sample Date 07 Dec 2023 17 Feb 2022 03 Oct 2020 10 Oct 2018Machine Hours 28551 24530 20530 13168Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.3 50.1 39.4 39.81
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 15 16 13 9Sodium ppm 0 5 8 <1Potassium ppm 2 <1 2 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 11 26 25Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 2 0 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 7 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3424 3562 4098 3682Magnesium ppm 52 122 12 10Zinc ppm 1487 1438 1562 1459Phosphorus ppm 1240 1208 1360 1203Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 59 126 151 102

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06033798 (Generated: 12/15/2023 08:53:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 617183\Rear Axle [VCP388516] 07 Dec 2023 @ 28551.0 hrs

