
[[W364006713]] VOLVO A40D 12815 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP422929
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: W364006713

364 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - MACON4807 HARRISON RDMACON, GAUS  31206Contact: PHILLIP CARVERphillip.carver@ascendummachinery.comT: (478)200-3300F: (478)200-5859
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. Clutch discwear or oil cooler leaching indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: ASCMACUnique No: 10789117Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: ASCMAC [WUSCAR] 06033888 (Generated: 12/18/2023 16:34:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHILLIP CARVER - ASCMAC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422929 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14914 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 57 --- --- ---Copper ppm 339 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 14 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 114 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm <1 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 179 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 80 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ASCMAC [WUSCAR] 06033888 (Generated: 12/18/2023 16:34:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PHILLIP CARVER - ASCMAC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 12815\Transmission (Auto) [VCP422929] 07 Jul 2023 @ 14914.0 hrs

