
[[SWO-068173 APAC]] VOLVO L150H 6814 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP447554
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SWO-068173 APAC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC1501 HWY 78 EASTOXFORD, ALUS  36203Contact: STEVE CAMPBELLstcampbell@cowin.comT: (256)832-5053F: (256)831-4295
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.The carboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: COWOXFUnique No: 10789198Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 21 Dec 2023
Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06033969 (Generated: 12/22/2023 06:49:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE CAMPBELL - COWOXF

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447554 VCP354666 VCP303044 VCP288650Sample Date 10 Dec 2023 12 Jun 2022 08 Mar 2021 06 Oct 2020Machine Hours 7105 5188 2676 3920Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.25 7.20 7.20 7.45Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT 0 NT 0Percentage Glycol % 46.6 46.4 46 46Freezing Point °C -26 -26 -29 -28
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Yllow Yllow Green Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06033969 (Generated: 12/22/2023 06:49:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE CAMPBELL - COWOXF
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6814\Coolant [VCP447554] 10 Dec 2023 @ 7105.0 hrs

