
[[SWA428779-10]] VOLVO A40G 352497 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426734
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWA428779-10

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10789218Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 19 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06033989 (Generated: 12/19/2023 14:28:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426734 VCP322795 VCP324316 VCP306252Sample Date 08 Dec 2023 28 Jun 2021 04 May 2021 03 Feb 2021Machine Hours 5137 1432 1085 510Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.5 12.5 10.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 86 87 89
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 74 66 73 68Sulfation (PA) % 55 67 66 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.2 <1.0 <1.0 0.8Silicon ppm 5 5 8 28Sodium ppm 1 2 6 2Potassium ppm <1 0 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 6 9 21Copper ppm 19 2 4 24Lead ppm 0 1 1 2Tin ppm <1 <1 2 2Aluminum ppm 3 0 0 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 50 64 45 38Nickel ppm 3 <1 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 10 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1553 1583 1641 1752Magnesium ppm 643 469 493 497Zinc ppm 1171 1027 1071 1086Phosphorus ppm 971 901 939 934Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 23 78 91 34

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06033989 (Generated: 12/19/2023 14:28:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352497\Diesel Engine [VCP426734] 08 Dec 2023 @ 5137.0 hrs

