
[[MW0000320]] FREIGHTLINER M2 JHJS0601 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420896
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: MW0000320

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10789537Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06034308 (Generated: 12/18/2023 12:15:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420896 VCP419411 VCP319486 VCP309737Sample Date 12 Dec 2023 09 Jun 2023 13 Aug 2021 20 Apr 2021Machine Hours 60120 4580 40364 34669Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.4 13.3 13.0 12.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 6.0 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 77 85 82 89
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.4 0.3 0.3Nitration (PA) % 90 92 95 99Sulfation (PA) % 57 62 58 62Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 5 3Sodium ppm 6 5 5 6Potassium ppm 5 16 10 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 25 14 12Copper ppm 2 3 2 2Lead ppm <1 <1 2 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 3 7 4 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 48 54 48 46Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1141 1147 1224 1179Magnesium ppm 685 889 764 701Zinc ppm 893 1153 781 820Phosphorus ppm 680 875 670 665Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 24 4 24 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06034308 (Generated: 12/18/2023 12:15:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	FREIGHTLINER FREIGHTLINER M2 JHJS0601\Diesel Engine [VCP420896] 12 Dec 2023 @ 60120.0 hrs

