
[[SW27740]] VOLVO EC380EL 311938 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP435850
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SW27740

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. There istoo much water present in thissample to perform a particle count.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10790463Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06035234 (Generated: 12/22/2023 17:00:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435850 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3146 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3146 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.0 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.39 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.660 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 20 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 164 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 454 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 390 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06035234 (Generated: 12/22/2023 17:00:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 311938\Hydraulic System [VCP435850] 13 Dec 2023 @ 3146.0 hrs

