
[[19]] VOLVO L90H 25607 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP313383
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 19

PLEASANT RIVER LUMBERPO BOX 68DOVER FOXCROFT, MEUS  04426Contact: BURLEY HIGGINSburley@pleasantriverlumber.comT: F: (207)564-8259
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: PLEDOVUnique No: 10791562Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Dec 2023
Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06036333 (Generated: 12/19/2023 15:28:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP313383 VCP387346 VCP358485 VCP351440Sample Date 01 Dec 2023 23 Feb 2023 22 Aug 2022 16 Mar 2022Machine Hours 13145 11022 8851 6727Oil Hours 2100 2000 2200 2500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 42.4 41.7 42.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 58 13 11 12Sodium ppm 7 0 3 6Potassium ppm 0 2 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 619 59 14 20Copper ppm 34 43 70 55Lead ppm 2 <1 7 <1Tin ppm 3 3 6 5Aluminum ppm 11 <1 1 1Chromium ppm 5 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 2 <1Nickel ppm 2 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 1Manganese ppm 6 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3681 3492 3141 3584Magnesium ppm 16 9 8 13Zinc ppm 1417 1482 1410 1564Phosphorus ppm 1322 1263 1238 1301Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 106 116 101 113

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06036333 (Generated: 12/19/2023 15:28:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 25607\Rear Axle [VCP313383] 01 Dec 2023 @ 13145.0 hrs

