
[[12]] VOLVO L120H 32363 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP406795
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 12

PLEASANT RIVER LUMBERPO BOX 68DOVER FOXCROFT, MEUS  04426Contact: BURLEY HIGGINSburley@pleasantriverlumber.comT: F: (207)564-8259
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLEDOVUnique No: 10791566Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 18 Dec 2023
Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06036337 (Generated: 12/18/2023 13:11:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406795 VCP299427 VCE192318 VCE218705Sample Date 21 Aug 2023 14 Jul 2021 15 Jul 2020 30 Apr 2019Machine Hours 15286 13134 9983 4800Oil Hours 2000 3000 2000 2000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.2 38.1 39.7 39.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG 0.246Silicon ppm 13 11 11 11Sodium ppm 7 6 8 1Potassium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 51 30 228 209Copper ppm 6 7 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 3 4Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 2 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 6 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 3 6Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2890 2685 4152 4203Magnesium ppm 20 12 13 12Zinc ppm 1259 1307 1577 1526Phosphorus ppm 1090 1195 1409 1298Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 99 108 130 126

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06036337 (Generated: 12/18/2023 13:11:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 32363\Front Axle [VCP406795] 21 Aug 2023 @ 15286.0 hrs

