
[[274]] JOHN DEERE 524K 1DW524KZFHF679355 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP413818
Oil Type: SHELL TELLUS S2 MX 46
Job No: 274

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Gear wear is indicated. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the fluid. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 10792384Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Dec 2023
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06037155 (Generated: 12/20/2023 13:33:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413818 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5950 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 71 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 815 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 48 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 627 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 484 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06037155 (Generated: 12/20/2023 13:33:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 524K 1DW524KZFHF679355\Transmission [VCP413818] 15 Nov 2023 @ 5950.0 hrs

