
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY/500 HOUR CSA [24585]] VOLVO A40G 352924 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP433702
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No: 24585

TRIANGLE GRADING AND PAVING INC1521 Huffman Mill RdBURLINGTON, NCUS  27216Contact: KAREN HILLIARDkhilliard@trianglegradingpaving.comT: (336)584-1745F: (336)584-0145
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TRIBURUnique No: 10792824Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Dec 2023
Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 06037595 (Generated: 12/27/2023 02:21:10) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHARLIE CANIPE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433702 ASC0000203 VCP0006412 VCP0005282Sample Date 14 Dec 2023 02 Aug 2023 30 Mar 2023 07 Dec 2022Machine Hours 2242 1513 998 520Oil Hours 1000 515 478 520Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.3 12.6 10.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.5 9.0 7.4 6.5Oxidation (PA) % 85 72 57 61
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 78 63 65 91Sulfation (PA) % 62 58 54 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 0.3 <1.0 0.5Silicon ppm 6 6 11 39Sodium ppm 1 2 <1 0Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 7 11 23Copper ppm 4 8 58 294Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 2Tin ppm 1 <1 2 4Aluminum ppm 1 2 1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 40 39 66 89Nickel ppm 4 1 4 4Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 4Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1624 1527 1361 2220Magnesium ppm 526 531 877 32Zinc ppm 1141 1036 1364 1164Phosphorus ppm 914 864 1101 1012Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 25 31 9 46

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRIBUR [WUSCAR] 06037595 (Generated: 12/27/2023 02:21:12) Rev: 1 Submitted By: CHARLIE CANIPE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352924\Diesel Engine [VCP433702] 14 Dec 2023 @ 2242.0 hrs

