
[[SPM634757]] SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3972 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP435649
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM634757

LEMONT SCRAP16229 NEW AVE.LEMONT, ILUS  60432Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: LEMLEMVCUnique No: 10793392Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Dec 2023
Report Id: LEMLEMVC [WUSCAR] 06038163 (Generated: 12/20/2023 17:59:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - LEMLEMVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435649 VCP415192 VCP420046 ---Sample Date 29 Nov 2023 12 Sep 2023 13 Jul 2023 ---Machine Hours 1168 646 291 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 64.6 65.7 67.4 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 6 11 9 ---Sodium ppm 13 15 19 ---Potassium ppm 8 3 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 9 53 ---Copper ppm 9 4 8 ---Lead ppm <1 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 3 1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2230 3654 3679 ---Magnesium ppm 13 10 12 ---Zinc ppm 1020 1497 1528 ---Phosphorus ppm 810 1174 1200 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 80 120 129 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEMLEMVC [WUSCAR] 06038163 (Generated: 12/20/2023 17:59:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - LEMLEMVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3972\Front Left Final Drive [VCP435649] 29 Nov 2023 @ 1168.0 hrs

