
[[SW1027392 CUSTOM LS]] VOLVO L220H 3310 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP441023
Oil Type: ATF
Job No: SW1027392 CUSTOM LS

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thefluid viscosity is higher than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of fluid.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10793490Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06038261 (Generated: 12/20/2023 17:58:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441023 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5870 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm 38 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 42 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1138 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 407 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 869 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 825 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 38 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06038261 (Generated: 12/20/2023 17:58:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3310\Transmission [VCP441023] 08 Dec 2023 @ 5870.0 hrs

