
VOLVO A25G 742113 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP439724
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

UNITED RENTALS5357 NC-11 NWINTERVILLE, NCUS  28590Contact: Christopher Sosebeecsosebee@ur.comT: 2(526)639-1147F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a moderate amountof fuel present in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: UNIWINVCUnique No: 10794351Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: UNIWINVC [WUSCAR] 06039122 (Generated: 12/22/2023 19:15:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Christopher Sosebee - UNIWINVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439724 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2830 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.6 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 72 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 5.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 111 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 55 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1173 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 736 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1175 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 955 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNIWINVC [WUSCAR] 06039122 (Generated: 12/22/2023 19:15:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Christopher Sosebee - UNIWINVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742113\Diesel Engine [VCP439724] 13 Oct 2023 @ 2830.0 hrs

