
VOLVO A40G 352489 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP436724
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10796043Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06040814 (Generated: 12/22/2023 12:33:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436724 VCP343010 VCP343143 ---Sample Date 13 Dec 2023 04 Nov 2021 04 Nov 2021 ---Machine Hours 6270 2323 2129 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 51.8 51.9 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 19 6 17 ---Sodium ppm 5 2 3 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 75 478 529 ---Copper ppm 4 3 14 ---Lead ppm 1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 1 <1 8 ---Chromium ppm 1 8 8 ---Molybdenum ppm 4 9 12 ---Nickel ppm <1 2 2 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm 3 19 24 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3386 14 57 ---Magnesium ppm 7 <1 3 ---Zinc ppm 1363 6 18 ---Phosphorus ppm 1157 2472 2705 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 151 270 207 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06040814 (Generated: 12/22/2023 12:33:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352489\Front Axle [VCP436724] 13 Dec 2023 @ 6270.0 hrs

