
[[40864 TURNER MINING]] VOLVO A45G 353402 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP306696
Oil Type: VOLVO
Job No: 40864 TURNER MINING

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: BEN COOGLERben.coogler@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Bearing and/or gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 10796056Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06040827 (Generated: 12/22/2023 17:07:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEN COOGLER - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP306696 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2700 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 38 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 760 --- --- ---Copper ppm 88 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 12 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 9 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 20 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 116 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 239 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2138 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 91 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06040827 (Generated: 12/22/2023 17:07:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BEN COOGLER - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353402\Drop Box [VCP306696] 15 Dec 2023 @ 2700.0 hrs

