
[[X10975 OLDCASTLE]] VOLVO L90H 626890 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP449108
Oil Type: VOLVO
Job No: X10975 OLDCASTLE

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Texarkana5401 SANDERSON LANETEXARKANA, ARUS  71854Contact: D. BELLdbell@scottcompanies.comT: (870)772-0204F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval tomonitor.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. No othercontaminants were detected in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1034Unique No: 10796098Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06040869 (Generated: 12/22/2023 11:45:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D. BELL - VOLVO1034

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449108 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 737 --- --- ---Oil Hours 737 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 148 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 7 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 10 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 141 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 74 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1034 [WUSCAR] 06040869 (Generated: 12/22/2023 11:45:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D. BELL - VOLVO1034
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626890\Transmission (Auto) [VCP449108] 15 Dec 2023 @ 737.0 hrs

