
[[A11691]] VOLVO ECR235E 311744 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP429669
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A11691

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10796632Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06041403 (Generated: 12/22/2023 13:11:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429669 VCP337105 VCP400281 VCP373475Sample Date 15 Dec 2023 18 Dec 2022 09 Dec 2022 07 Jul 2022Machine Hours 4195 3633 3633 3115Oil Hours 2000 1500 1088 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.9 42.7 284 40.6Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.85 0.50 1.39 0.53
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 103133 11798 141947 ---Particles >6µm 16213 471 47159 ---Particles >14µm 26 25 5338 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/12 21/16/12 24/23/20 ---Silicon ppm 7 5 3 4Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Potassium ppm 1 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 7 33 6Copper ppm 14 11 6 14Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 1 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1161 1031 41 115Magnesium ppm 18 16 <1 2Zinc ppm 816 704 34 515Phosphorus ppm 708 592 983 398Barium ppm 6 0 0 0Boron ppm 37 23 168 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06041403 (Generated: 12/22/2023 13:11:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235E 311744\Hydraulic System [VCP429669] 15 Dec 2023 @ 4195.0 hrs

