
[[A11676]] VOLVO L70H 622711 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP442530
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A11676

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10796939Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Dec 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06041710 (Generated: 12/21/2023 15:35:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442530 VCP400350 VCP317487 VCP284131Sample Date 12 Dec 2023 08 Mar 2023 05 Jul 2021 13 Jul 2020Machine Hours 4890 4425 3010 2959Oil Hours 500 1000 1000 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 47.5 46.3 40.6 40.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 11 13 10 12Sodium ppm 1 0 1 4Potassium ppm <1 2 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 13 22 14Copper ppm 0 <1 <1 0Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 3 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 4 2 2Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3568 3840 4003 3813Magnesium ppm 56 55 25 26Zinc ppm 1519 1530 1504 1515Phosphorus ppm 1261 1238 1346 1142Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 110 110 251 118

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06041710 (Generated: 12/21/2023 15:35:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622711\Front Axle [VCP442530] 12 Dec 2023 @ 4890.0 hrs

