
VOLVO L150H 6989 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP407072
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 10802386Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Dec 2023
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06041778 (Generated: 12/26/2023 23:27:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407072 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5961 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.19 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 46.5 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -26 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06041778 (Generated: 12/26/2023 23:27:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6989\Coolant [VCP407072] 15 Dec 2023 @ 5961.0 hrs

