
SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3324 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP406852
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No:

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10802542Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Dec 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 06041934 (Generated: 12/22/2023 14:18:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406852 VCP406652 VCP327357 VCP370237Sample Date 12 Dec 2023 20 Jul 2023 20 Jun 2023 03 May 2023Machine Hours 10562 9414 9153 8745Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.4 11.4 11.6 12.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 6.3 7.0 7.7Oxidation (PA) % 60 88 92 76
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 55 68 67 47Sulfation (PA) % 53 60 62 55Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 4 4 4Sodium ppm 0 0 <1 0Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 <1 2 2Copper ppm 0 0 0 0Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 2 2 0Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 60 72 60 31Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1108 1943 1817 1737Magnesium ppm 821 121 297 425Zinc ppm 1196 1130 1153 1116Phosphorus ppm 1004 986 978 904Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 12 57 51 45

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 06041934 (Generated: 12/22/2023 14:18:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.3324\Diesel Engine [VCP406852] 12 Dec 2023 @ 10562.0 hrs

