
[[11720]] VOLVO EC290BLC 11337 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP439459
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: 11720

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Appearance is hazy. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The amount andsize of particulates present in thesystem are acceptable. The AN levelis acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10802681Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06042073 (Generated: 12/28/2023 10:29:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439459 VCP254838 VCP225103 ---Sample Date 18 Dec 2023 08 Apr 2020 17 Sep 2018 ---Machine Hours 1280 675 8260 ---Oil Hours 0 1500 1500 ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.4 41.4 42.16 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.32 1.426 1.336 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.390 NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 1018 --- 129240 ---Particles >6µm 554 --- 9848 ---Particles >14µm 94 --- 245 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 17/16/14 --- 24/20/15 ---Silicon ppm 9 8 7 ---Sodium ppm 7 7 8 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 13 13 ---Copper ppm 24 7 4 ---Lead ppm 1 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 3 2 2 ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 4 5 2 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 2 3 4 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1682 2718 2262 ---Magnesium ppm 53 70 36 ---Zinc ppm 1029 1148 1038 ---Phosphorus ppm 886 944 801 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 7 7 8 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06042073 (Generated: 12/28/2023 10:30:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC290BLC 11337\Hydraulic System [VCP439459] 18 Dec 2023 @ 1280.0 hrs

