
SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.2121 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP327405
Oil Type: VG 220
Job No:

UNITED SCRAP1545 S CICERO AVECICERO, ILUS  60804Contact: RON LUCHTENBURGrluchten@unitedscrap.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: UNICICILUnique No: 10803048Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Dec 2023
Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 06042440 (Generated: 12/24/2023 11:30:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP327405 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10997 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 16 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 44 --- --- ---Copper ppm 17 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3593 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1560 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1277 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 110 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UNICICIL [WUSCAR] 06042440 (Generated: 12/24/2023 11:30:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RON LUCHTENBURG - UNICICIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 825 825.0.2121\Rear Axle [VCP327405] 16 Dec 2023 @ 10997.0 hrs

