
[[SWA411361-10]] VOLVO L220H 3195 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP432405
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SWA411361-10

CALLANAN INDUSTRIES93 SULLIVAN RDMONTICELLO, NYUS  12701Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CALMONNYUnique No: 10804174Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 27 Dec 2023
Report Id: CALMONNY [WUSCAR] 06043566 (Generated: 12/27/2023 12:22:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - CALMONNY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432405 VCP419116 VCP390235 VCP342786Sample Date 29 Oct 2023 21 Aug 2023 01 Nov 2022 20 Jun 2022Machine Hours 11063 10636 8642 7636Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.6 41.5 41.8 42.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 35 12 13Sodium ppm 7 9 8 9Potassium ppm 0 5 0 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 82 51 24 14Copper ppm 1 0 0 <1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 15 1 1Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3023 3941 3867 1871Magnesium ppm 18 20 17 12Zinc ppm 1340 1597 1621 1082Phosphorus ppm 1190 1267 1205 979Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 105 146 132 95

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALMONNY [WUSCAR] 06043566 (Generated: 12/27/2023 12:22:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - CALMONNY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3195\Rear Axle [VCP432405] 29 Oct 2023 @ 11063.0 hrs

