
[[W08010166 HERC]] VOLVO L70H 624777 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP407639
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: W08010166 HERC

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - CHESAPEAKE4112 HOLLAND BLVDCHESAPEAKE, VAUS  23323Contact: TOMMY GRIFFINtgriffin@mcclung-logan.comT: (757)485-3314F: (757)485-3415
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. We recommendyou service and check the fuel filtersfor mucous-like deposits.  Check withfuel supplier for biocides available todestroy the microorganisms in thefuel system.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thecooling system. Appearance is hazy.Excessive free water present.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0264Unique No: 10805946Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0264 [WUSCAR] 06045338 (Generated: 01/05/2024 09:03:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY GRIFFIN - VOLVO0264

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407639 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 389 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.37 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.042 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0264 [WUSCAR] 06045338 (Generated: 01/05/2024 09:03:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY GRIFFIN - VOLVO0264
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624777\Diesel Fuel [VCP407639] 21 Dec 2023 @ 389.0 hrs

