
[[2826]] VOLVO A40G 342608 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP331576
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 2826

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10806382Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06045774 (Generated: 12/28/2023 13:58:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP331576 VCP331546 VCP339701 VCP405670Sample Date 11 Dec 2023 06 Nov 2023 03 Oct 2023 21 Aug 2023Machine Hours 11060 10895 10659 10330Oil Hours 165 236 329 296Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 13.0 12.6 12.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.7 7.0 8.1 10.1Oxidation (PA) % 59 63 72 82
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 68 72 63 56Sulfation (PA) % 50 52 55 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.3Silicon ppm 4 5 4 4Sodium ppm 5 14 4 4Potassium ppm 5 7 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 3 4 4Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 0Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 4 4 3 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 120 115 70 37Nickel ppm 2 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1207 1340 1468 1657Magnesium ppm 636 705 551 523Zinc ppm 831 963 888 863Phosphorus ppm 749 736 744 729Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 121 130 56 41

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06045774 (Generated: 12/28/2023 13:58:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342608\Diesel Engine [VCP331576] 11 Dec 2023 @ 11060.0 hrs

